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The bulb onion (Allium cepa) is an important crop for farmers’ income and
overall economy and food security of Tajikistan. During a limited survey
of onion fields near Dushanbe in June 2011, we observed onion plants
showing characteristic diamond-shaped lesions (with or without green
islands) on leaves and scapes (Fig. 1). Since these symptoms are
characteristic of Iris yellow spot virus (IYSV), a thrips-transmitted virus
belonging to the genus Tospovirus in the family Bunyaviridae (Gent et al.,
2006), leaf samples were imprinted on FTA® Classic Cards (Whatman
International Ltd., Maidstone, UK), air-dried and brought to the laboratory
at Washington State University for confirmatory diagnostic tests. Viral
nucleic acids were eluted from five FTA cards (Alabi et al., 2008)
representing five separate onion samples and subjected to reverse
transcription (RT)-PCR using primers (IYSV56U and IYSV917L)
flanking the nucleocapsid protein (NP) gene of IYSV (Robène-Soustrade
et al., 2006. A single DNA product of approximately 896 base pairs (bp)
was amplified from all samples. The 896 bp DNA fragments were cloned
separately into pCR2.1 (Invitrogen Corp., Carlsbad, CA) and two
independent clones per amplicon were sequenced in both orientations. In
pairwise comparisons, complete NP gene coding sequences of isolates
from Tajikistan (GenBank Accessions Nos. JQ814625 to JQ814630)
showed 99-100% nucleotide (nt) identities among themselves and 87-98%
nt identities with corresponding NP gene sequences of global IYSV
isolates. Maximum likelihood phylogenetic analysis revealed that IYSV
isolates from Tajikistan are more closely related to isolates from Serbia
(EU586203, EU750697) and Italy (FJ185142) with >70% bootstrap
support (1000 replicates; Fig. 2). Thrips tabaci was observed in onion
flowers. To our knowledge, this is the first confirmed report of IYSV in
onions in Tajikistan. In recent years, IYSV has been reported in many
onion-growing regions and our finding of its occurrence in Central Asia,
considered as the centre of origin for onion, expands our knowledge of
global distribution of IYSV.
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